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Stock Total
No. Unit   Item Description Quantity Unit Cost Discounted Cost (VAT-INC)          Cost

unit

Description : White Wine / Alsace, France

Tasting Notes: Pale straw yellow and bright to the eye. Intense 
nose that smells of white peach and apple, acacia and hawthorn. 
Warm and enveloping in taste, full-bodied, enlivened by the 
mineral flavor.

12

unit

Description : White Wine / Burgundy, France

Tasting Notes: The nose is restrained and floral; the palate is 
rounded, with generous citrus and melon fruit. The finish is crisp 
and mineral, with a waft of toasty oak.

7

unit

Description : Red Wine / Bordeaux, France

Tasting Notes: Smoke, truffles, black cherries, licorice, spice and a 
hint of chocolate create the character here. Supple, creamy and 
fresh, with sweetness and scorched earth nuances on the palate 
that work perfectly with all the sweet, fresh cherries and a touch of 
spearmint in the finish.

10

unit Description : Red Wine / Burgundy, France

Tasting Notes: Fresh fruit character, a blend of red and black 
berries. Superb, elegant and easy-to-drink red wine. 

7

unit Description : Red Wine / Bordeaux, France
Tasting Notes: Cassis, plum and cherry aromas adorn the nose. 
The palate brings grippy but ripe tannins, gentle acidity and a 
pencil-lead finish. 

5

unit
Description: Red Wine / Burgundy, France

Tasting Notes: Plenty of red berry fruit, a hint of perfume and a 
fresh finish of chalky tannins and mouth-watering acidity.

5

unit

Description: Champagne / Champagne, France
Tasting Notes: This  has hits of dried pear, hazelnuts, dried flowers 
and spices. Rich, creamy and expressive, impresses with its 
gorgeous overall balance. 

2

unit

1990-2013 
Description: Sweet Wine

Tasting Notes: A rich, fruity liqueur from Champagne house, 
packed with aromas of roasted nuts, berry fruits and spices, and a 
full-bodied palate of stewed stone fruit, grapes and candied orange 
peel.

3

unit

CLASSIC RANGE PEATED CASK BLENDED MALT SCOTCH 
WHISKY 44.2% 
Description: Blended Whisky / Scotland

Tasting Notes: Well balanced, with peat aromas giving the edge. 
Fruity undertones deliver a rich complexity. A fruity sweetness 
introduces the soft peaty character. Well balanced to perfection.

6



unit

Description: Red Wine / Bordeaux, France

Tasting Notes: Gently floral top notes make way for darker 
hedgerow fruit, cassis, and a hint of pencil shavings.The palate is 
generous and rich, with round, velvety tannins, while a dose of 
acidity navigates through the layers of blackberries and 
blueberries, bringing balance and elegance.

2

unit Wine Paper Bag
Description: Packaging

59

unit

Description: Rose Wine / Provence, France

Tasting Notes: Sweet strawberry dominates the nose with a hint of 
fennel, wild oregano and garden sage. A twist of wild raspberries 
lingers on the long, balanced and sophisticated finish.

9

unit

Description: Champagne / Champagne, France

Tasting Notes: Pale yellow with faint green highlights and delicate 
bubbles. On the nose, lively and cheerful, fresh, light-hearted, fine, 
delicate and generous. Elegant and lively with a very nice and 
lingering finish on the palate.

3

xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx

ABC                                   Php  150,000.00

Purpose:
For official use of OCS, chargeable against MOOE.

Requested by : Approved by:
Signature

Printed Name: CHARES MARIE R. TORRES-ELACION ALAN L. DENIEGA
Designation: Administrative Officer Assistant Secretary

 


